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ABSTRACT

Background. The CONCORD study compares population-based relative survival
from cancer using data from cancer registries in five continents. To estimate relative
survival, general mortality life tables are required. Available statistics are incomplete,
so various approaches are used to construct complete life tables. This article outlines
how the life tables were constructed for CONCORD; it compares life expectancy at
birth between 101 populations covered by cancer registries in 31 countries and com-
pares the impact of two approaches to the deployment of life tables in relative sur-
vival analysis.

Methods. The CONCORD approach, using specific mathematical methods, produced
complete (single-year-of-age) life tables by sex, cancer registry area, calendar year
(1990-1999) and race (only in the USA). In order to study the impact of different ap-
proaches, we compared relative survival in the USA using the US national life table,
centered on the relevant census years, and the CONCORD approach. We estimated
relative survival in each American participating cancer registry for patients diagnosed
with breast (women), colorectal or prostate cancer during 1990-1994 and followed up
to 1999.

Results. Average life expectancy at birth during 1990-1999 varied in CONCORD can-
cer registry areas from 64 to 78 years in males and from 71 to 84 years in females. It
increased during the 1990s more in men than in women. In the USA, it was lower in
blacks than in whites. Relative survival in American populations was lower with the
CONCORD approach, which incorporates trends and geographic variation in back-
ground mortality, than with the USA census life tables.

Conclusions. International variation in background mortality by geographic area,
calendar time, race, age and sex is wide. We suggest that in international comparisons
of cancer relative survival, complete life tables that are specific for cancer registry
area, calendar year and race should be used.
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